
Name:

Priority 1:  Provide a 
brief description of 

the specific 
legislative issue

Priority 1:  Desired 
Outcome:  Clearly 

articulate the desired 
outcome you hope to 

achieve through 
legislative action

Priority 1:  Impact:  
Explain the positive 

impact achieving this 
outcome would have 

on students, staff, 
and the school 

district

Priority 2:  Provide a 
brief description of 

the specific 
legislative issue

Priority 3:  Provide a 
brief description of 

the specific 
legislative issue

Priority 4:  Provide a 
brief description of 

the specific 
legislative issue

Priority 5:  Provide a 
brief description of 

the specific 
legislative issue

Priority 2:  Desired 
Outcome:  Clearly 

articulate the desired 
outcome you hope to 

achieve through 
legislative action

Priority 2:  Impact:  
Explain the positive 

impact achieving this 
outcome would have 

on students, staff, 
and the school 

district

Chris Meyer

Fixing the SOQ 
funding formula that 
short changes our 

school districts each 
year.

A legislative fix.

Ability of School 
Boards to hold their 

own funding 
referendums or bond 

votes

Receive the power to 
raise funds beyond the 
groveling we have to 

do to our local 
Council.

Better facilities.

Lisa School Facilities 
Funding

Amend the Code of 
VA to allow all 

localities the option of 
increasing local sales 
taxes specifically for 
the purpose of school 
construction and major 
renovation/modernizati

on.

Local control and 
specific CIP funding 

for school 
construction/moderniz
ation to address all of 
our buildings and new 
construction needed.

Election of Board of 
Education Members

Would require the 
BOE to provide 

standards that parallel 
SOQ and SOL but 
specific to building 

maintenance (physical 
environment of Va. 

School buildings) with 
my interest being in 

Air Quality monitoring 

Support of changing 
the selection method 

of members of the 
State BOE from 

appointment by the 
Governor to election 
by local school board 

members, on a 
Congressional district 
basis (one per district)

Standards of 
Maintenance Bill or 

legislation


